CONSENT ITEM

RE: GOLF COURSE CHEMICALS

DEPARTMENT: PARKS AND RECREATION

PROGRAM: GOLF COURSE

RECOMMENDATION: Award purchase to the lowest unit priced vendor that meets
specifications on an as needed basis; based on weather and playing conditions not to exceed
budgeted amounts

EXPLANATION: A Request for Proposal was prepared by Golf Course Superintendent
Crocker to seek pricing for the purchase of fertilizers, fungicides, herbicides, and miscellaneous
chemicals to be used during the upcoming golf season. The RFP was advertised on the city’s
website, in the St. Louis Business Journal, and sent to several local providers of golf course
chemicals. On February 24, 2015 five sealed bids were received and opened.

A total of $40,685 was budgeted for chemicals this year, the same as in 2014; including $14,865
for herbicides/insecticides, $17,000 for fungicides, and $9,000 for the purchase of fertilizers.
Attached is a spreadsheet of the results. Weather conditions will dictate which chemicals will be
needed as well as the quantities. Also, as in the past, fertilizer prices are only good for 30 days.
Regardless, staff is recommending purchase of chemicals from the lowest unit based bidder in
each category.

If you have any questions, please let me know.
SUBMITTED BY: LINDA BRUER, CPRP
DIRECTOR OF PARKS AND RECREATION

DATE: MARCH 2, 2015



Product Greenspro lohn Deere Helena Supreme Turf A'grblggiés A. Environ

Milorganite Fairway no bid $9.24 $10.00 $8.70 no bid no bid
Milorganite Greens! no bid $10.26 $10.50 $9.20 no bid no bid
18-9-18 i $52.90 $50.00 no bid $52.90 $50.00 no bid
18-3-4 ‘ $98.75 $39.34 $45.00 $80.00 no bid no bid
0-3-18 | $95.00 $32.12 $37.50 $85.00 $115.00 no bid
15-0-0 | $34.50 $24.21 $25.00 $60.00 no bid no bid
Brexil | no bid $23.60 $46.25 no bid no bid no bid
14-14-14 no bid $22.87 $31.00 $34.00 no bid no bid
Gypsum ‘ $9.00 $11.79 $10.70 $6.80 no bid no bid
10-0-8 i $38.00 $24.12 no bid $27.50 no bid no bid
10-2-8 Nature Safe| $34.00 $22.87 no bid $35.00 $24.00 no bid
RenoJa ! no bid no bid $125.00 $185.00 $125.00 no bid
Micropurients no bid $23.62 $25.00 $430.00 $120.00 no bid
Hydrg-Hume no bid $41.49 $43.75 no bid $100.00 no bid
Buffer Agent no bid $29.52 $62.50 no bid no bid no bid
Sticker no bid $61.97 $55.00 no bid no bid no bid
Resenvoir | $86.00 $91.79 no bid no bid no bid no bid
P e e— no bid $472.82 no bid no bid no bid $868.37
Spray| Indicator $86.00 $55.97 $26.50 $85.00 no bid no bid
Lake Colorant $265.00 $86.48 $336.50 no bid no bid $282.80
Wett|ng Agent | $170.00 $130.38 $155.00 no bid no bid no bid




Product

Greenspro John Deere Helena Supreme Turf Agrologics A. Environ
Banner Maxx i $214.00 $214.00 $214.00 $214.00 no bid no bid
Generif. Propiconazole| $80.00 $93.88 $67.00 no bid no bid no bid
Banol | $608.00 $925.00 $925.00 $925.00 no bid no bid
Bayletbn \ $699.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 no bid no bid
Daconil Weathemtick i $146.25 $146.25 $146.25 $146.25 no bid no bid
Daonil|Action \ $185.00 $185.00 $185.00 $185.00 no bid no bid
Disarn} || $320.00 $301.22 $288.00 no bid $288.00 no bid
Insignia | : ‘ $1,470.10 $1,470.10 $1,470.10 $1,573.80 no bid no bid
Instrata | | $395.00 $395.00 $395.00 $395.00 no bid no bid
Chipcg 26GT | $375.00 $370.91 $293.00 $325.00 no bid no bid
Generic Iprodione | | $175.00 $157.07 $112.00 $130.00 $145.00 no bid
Prostar I ‘ $740.00 $195.00 $636.00 $700.00 no bid no bid
Tartan ' $1,100.00 $1,100.00 $1,100.00 $1,100.00 no bid no bid
Tritor(Discontinueid) i no bid $927.67 no bid no bid no bid no bid
Subdpe Maxx | | $510.00 $510.00 $510.00 $510.00 no bid no bid
Tebutonazole $103.00 $97.01 $79.00 $85.00 $100.00 no bid
Primg | " $283.00 $283.00 $283.00 $283.00 $255.00 no bid
Trimmit| | $434.00 $434.00 $398.00 $995.00 $240.00 no bid
Zerotol ; I\ no bid $143.18 $120.00 no bid no bid no bid
Quarta | ‘| no bid $111.29 $106.25 no bid no bid no bid
Brisklvay '\ $1,290.00 $1,290.00 $1,290.00 $1,290.00 no bid no bid
Tourey, I $672.50 $672.50 $672.50 $672.50 no bid no bid
Signature || $1,111.00 $140.00 $1,111.00 $1,111.00 no bid no bid
Secufe | N $290.50 $290.50 $290.50 $290.50 no bid no bid
Herifage i [ $509.00 $509.00 $509.00 $509.00 $230.00 no bid
Headway ! ‘ $417.00 $417.00 $417.00 $417.00 no bid no bid




~ Ballwin Golf Club Chemical Bid

Product ' Gréenspro ‘John Deere Helena Supreme Turf T, V]-Aérlolorgics A. Envirbﬁ
Battleship | $150.00 $147.01 $130.00 no bid no bid no bid
Barricadeg l‘ $142.00 $142.00 $142.50 $142.00 no bid no bid
Generid P!rodiamine T $224.00 $133.04 $110.00 $1,620.00 no bid no bid
Benzun e;: l‘ $325.00 $312.22 $275.00 $265.00 no bid no bid
Copper SJ Ifate T| $136.00 $66.99 $50.00 no bid no bid no bid
Katana I\ no bid $194.24 $166.00 $695.00 no bid no bid
Pennant i no bid $241.70 $135.00 $195.00 no bid no bid
Revolver } $550.00 no bid $207.00 $550.00 no bid no bid
Ronstar [ $400.00 $400.00 $400.00 $400.00 no bid no bid
Round-Up Pro l $73.50 $55.30 $53.44 $70.00 no bid no bid
SedgeHammer ﬂ $90.00 $73.75 $74.50 $82.00 no bid no bid
Snapshiot i $86.00 $87.70 $81.50 $94.00 no bid no bid
Hardball | | no bid no bid $75.00 no bid no bid no bid
Speedzone | no bid $232.10 $170.00 $172.50 no bid no bid
0-0-7 I:imlension ‘I $18.00 $16.40 $15.90 no bid no bid no bid
17-0-3 Dir}nension I‘ no bid $23.54 $21.20 no bid no bid no bid
Acelepryn } $927.50 $927.50 $927.50 $927.50 no bid no bid
Horticyltural Oil \ no bid $35.36 $11.00 $70.00 no bid no bid
Meridign E $382.50 $100.74 $83.13 $1,734.00 no bid no bid
Sevin ﬁ $204.00 $118.23 $122.50 $95.00 no bid no bid
Safari ‘| no bid $103.06 $330.00 $375.00 no bid no bid
Talstar \ no bid $79.92 $49.00 $56.00 no bid no bid
Generic Bifenthrin ‘ no bid no bid $43.00 no bid no bid no bid
0-0-7 Merjt } $19.75 $17.79 $16.07 $17.50 no bid no bid
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