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Parks & Recreation

Memo

To:  Eric Hanson, City Administrator
From: Linda Bruer, Director of Parks and Recreation
Date: February 22, 2017

RE: Golf Course Chemical Bids

$38,500 was budgeted in 2017 for the purpose of purchasing herbicides, insecticides,
fungicides, and fertilizers for the golf course. Superintendent Crocker uses a variety of
chemicals in varying quantities within each of these categories to treat different conditions
based on weather and other circumstances that may occur on the course throughout the
season.

A request for proposal was advertised and sealed bids were received from four companies
including Greenspro, SiteOne, Helena, and Advance Turf on February 21, 2017. Attached is
a schedule of pricing the companies provided for each product requested. It should be noted
that not every company can provide every product and some products provided may or may
not meet our specifications. In addition, container quantities can vary between suppliers for a
particular product; thus the large variances in pricing for some products. Therefore, award to
one bidder for all chemicals is not practical.

With that being said, staff is requesting approval to purchase chemicals from the lowest
bidder for a particular product that meets the specification for that particular product in the
quantity that makes the most sense for that specific use and time of the season. Total
chemical purchase for the year will not exceed the budgeted amount of $38,500.

If you have any questions with regard to the bids or recommendation, please let us know.



Ballwin Golf Club Chemical Bid 2017

Product Greenspro SiteOne Helena Advanced Turf

18-3-4 $201.45 $33.64 $50.00 $36.00
13-2-3 $220.60 $62.71 $22.00 $69.00
15-0-0 $90.00 $20.70 $55.00 no bid
3-7-18 Potassium $283.05 $40.86 $65.00 no bid
0-3-18 Potassium $190.00 $27.46 $15.00 no hid
Liquid Micro $190.00 $63.51 $22.00 $79.00
Powder Micro no bid $22.32 $50.00 $57.00
Liquid Amino $400.00 $114.77 $50.00 $199.00
Liquid Humic no bid $38.48 $15.00 $57.00
Organic 10-0-8 $40.00 $49.87 no bid $27.50
Organic 10-2-8 $34.00 $32.63 no bid $22.50
13-2-13 Amm Sulfate $36.00 $26.20 no bid $36.00
Banner Maxx $432.00 $216.00 $216.00 no bid
Generic Banner $200.00 $272.81 $67.00 §117.95
Banol $1,912.50 $956.25 $425.00 $956.25
Dac ZN $250.00 $125.00 $50.00 no bid
Dac Weatherstick $305.00 $152.50 $61.00 no bid
Dac Action $384.00 $192.00 $76.00 no bid
Disarm $300.00 $1,103.00 no bid $1,103.00
Insignia $412.97 $412.97 5412.97 $412.97




Ballwin Golf Club Chemical Bid

Product Greenspro SiteOne Helena Advance Turf

Instrata $800.00 $400.00 $160.00 no bid
Iprodione $285.00 §126.19 $57.25 $160.00
Prostar $780.00 $240.77 $54.85 $179.00
Tartan $1,980.00 $990.00 $990.00 $990.00
Thiophanate Methyl $430.00 5172.15 $58.00 $175.55
Subdue Maxx $1,030.00 $515.00 $515.00 $443.31
Tebuconazole $390.00 $68.82 $59.00 $79.00
Primo $580.00 $290.00 $149.00 $199.00
Trimmit $442.00 $442.00 $170.00 $235.38
Appear $516.00 $258.00 $128.00 $133.00
Briskway $1,300.00 $1,300.00 $1,300.00 no bid
Tourney $693.00 $692.75 $128.55 $695.00
Prodigy Signature no bid $164.69 $1,133.25 $156.25
Xzemplar $788.88 $197.22 $197.22 $197.22
Secure $302.50 $302.50 $605.00 $510.00
Heritage $317.00 $509.00 $509.00 $700.00
Headway $834.00 $417.00 $417.00 no bid
Herbicide Post #1 $160.00 $70.20 $88.00 $68.00
Herbicide Post #2 no bid $228.04 $70.00 $208.00
Barricade $143.00 $143.00 $143.00 no bid
Bensumec $660.00 $326.61 $115.00 $339.40
Pennant no bid 5232.83 $200.00 no bid
Ronstar Liquid $412.50 $412.50 $412.50 $412.50
Round-up Pro $140.00 $69.42 $33.58 no bid
Glyphosate Generic $120.00 $51.19 $12.00 $36.00
Prosedge $85.00 $72.49 $70.00 $79.00




Ballwin Golf Club Chemical Bid

Product Greenspro SiteOne Helena Advanced Turf

Snapshot $80.00 §77.99 $81.50 $82.00
Aquatic Herbicide no bid $63.88 $29.00 $53.43
Aquatic Glyphosate $127.50 $60.94 $20.00 no bid
0-0-7 Dimension $21.00 $15.12 $17.26 §17.21
17-0-3 Dimension no bid $21.88 $20.25 $20.21
Acelepryn Liquid $963.50 $963.50 $963.50 no bid
Talstar no bid $51.89 $49.00 $40.00
Spray Indicator $160.00 $51.97 $25.00 $29.00
Non-lonic Sticker $190.00 $72.65 $22.00 $62.03
Wetting Agent Liquid $350.00 $128.06 $62.00 $189.00
Pond Bacteria Treatment $95.00 $232.83 no bid $658.00
Lake Dye Black $265.00 $80.98 $67.00 $62.00




